
Atlante Pre -Season Time Line 

April 
2025 

Confirma�on of teams by coaches age and playing 
division for the next season. Includes new teams. 

1 

May 30, 
2025 

Each team to register the minimum number of 
players required for the specific age they will be 
playing. All paid 

2 

July, 2025 All coaches to have completed all the required 
licenses or training to be cleared to coach in the 
coming season 

3 

Coaches assigned to more than one team will be 
required to have an assistant for each team. To be 
able to cover in the absences of a coach. 

4 

August, 
2025 

Coaches must have a copy on hand of the league 
gaming rules but also to have read the league rules 
for the coming season 

5 

Coaches must review the season schedules and if any 
changes or errors must be reported right away to our 
club scheduler. To include home or away games. 

6 

As required by SoCal all teams registered under 
Atlante must wear the same game uniform. 

7 

All Players That are going to be 17 before June 2024, 
Need to complete the Safe Sport Cer�ficate before 
They are register to a Team (The Safe Sport needs to 
have the players Name) 

8 

All teams will be required to pay all penalty fines 
resul�ng from forfei�ng a game. 

9 

All incidents during the season must be reported to 
the club president right away. Writen reports must 
include: Game #, Opponent, Game loca�on, �me 
Detail descrip�on of what happened. Eye witness 
reports if available, it can be from your parents. 

10 


